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SOLICITATION NUMBER: ARFQ DC.R2600000073

Addendum Number: 1 

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as 
("Solicitation") to reflect the change(s) identified and described below. 

Applicable Addendum Category: 

[ ✓ ] Modify bid opening date and time

Modify specifications of product or service being sought 

[ ✓ ] Attachment of vendor questions and responses

Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet 

Correction of error 

I ✓ l Other 

Description of Modification to Solicitation: 

Bid Opening Date will be January 16, 2026 at 11 :00 
Attach Vendor Question with response from the Agency 
Attach Update to Exhibit A - Pricing Page 

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been 
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference. 

Terms and Conditions: 

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012 
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50

25

100

$49

$87

$60

$42

NO BID
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$2800
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4900

8700

6000

4200

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

280000

50

25

100

$60

$42

NO BID

NO BID

$2800

60 Watt PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE60), or Equal

Box for cable management for Large 9" Transcendent PTZ Cameras(VT-TPT-
JB01), or Equal

3.5" Seagate SkyHawk AI 24TB Video Hard Drive(ST2400VE002), or Equal

3.5" Seagate IronWolf Pro Video Surveillance Enterprice Mass Storage 
System(ST20000NT001), or Equal

Vitek-NDAA Compliant Transcendent series 16 MegaPixel 360º Panoramic IP 
Camera(VTD-TND16X8MS), or Equal

$74625100$7470.00%74700

100

100

100

100

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

100

100

100

100

25 $24,200

3.1.7 $60 25 1500 0.00% $60 25 $1500

3.1.6 $968 25 24200 0.00%

25 $3937.5

3.1.5 $1230 25 30750 0.00% $1230 25 $123,000

3.1.4 $157.5 25 3937.5 0.00%

25

0.00% $405 100 $40,500

3.1.3 $390 100 39000 0.00% $390 100 $39,000

3.1.1

3.1.2 $405 100 40500

300000 0.00% $12000

$157.5

$968

3.1.8

3.1.9

3.1.10

3.1.11

3.1.12

3.1.13

3.1.14

3.1.15

Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

Vitek Video Surveillance Enterprise Mass Storage System(VT-TMSS24EN), or 
Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA compliant 8MP Transcendent Panoramic 
Camera(VTC-TNT2X4MSN), or Equal

$300,000

Transcendent Series 4 MegaPixel License Plate Recognition WDR IP Motorized 
Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB4LPRN-A), or Equal

Wall Mount Gasket for Transcendent IP PTZs(VT-TPT25HR-WMG), or Equal

95 Wall PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE95), or Equal

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$12000 25

100$747

$49

$87

Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP Dual Sensor 180º Panoramic camera(VTC-
TNT2X4MSNAD), or Equal

Transcendent Analog/HD-COAX IP Video Encoder Server(VT-IPE-HDA5), or Equal

Vitek 64 Channel 16 Mega Pixel 4K Real Time Network Video Recorderd with GEN 
IV Advanced Analytics Support(VT-TNR6480E1N), or Equal

Transcendent 4 channel Decoder(VT-104VWD), or Equal

Vitek POE 60-Watt mid-span injector(VT-POE60-Watt), or Equal



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.
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ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage
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0.00%
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14250
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$825

$683
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25
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100

100

25

$360

$1,125

$417

$1,455

$109

$635

$49

$124

$124

NO BID

$570

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD2RMS), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP Dome IP Camera(VTD-TND6MEA), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP 360º IP Panoramic Dome Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), 
or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP 180º IP Panoramic Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), 
or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ4AD-4M), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-8PNS), or Equal

Vitek Ceiling/Pedestal Mount(VT-TPT20HR-PM), or Equal

Extension Mounting Bracket(VT-TWM36), or Equal

Extension Mounting Adapter(VT-TCNM36), or Equal

Vitek - On Alert Series 4MP Wifi H.265 IP Bullet Camera(VT-TNB4FW02), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8-Channel Netowrk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR818PFN), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 16-Channel Netowk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR1646PFN), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 32-Channel Network Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR3280E1N), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant Hybrid Digital Video Recorder or DVR/NVR(VT-
TR8NHA1620), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4Mp Bullet IP Camera(VTC-TNB4RMA4), or Equal

3.1.16

3.1.17

3.1.28

3.1.29

3.1.30

3.1.23

3.1.24

3.1.25

3.1.26

3.1.27

3.1.18

3.1.19

3.1.20

3.1.21

3.1.22



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.
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Catalog Discount Percentage

$5,800

$7,200

$8,300

#VALUE!
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$113
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$98

$6,450

$180

$910

NO BID

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 5MP Dome IP Camera(TND5RMEA), 
or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 6TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST6000VX001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 8TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST8000VE001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 10TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST10000VE001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 12TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST12000VE001), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 4MP Bullet IP Camera(TVC-
TNB4RMA4), or Equal

Vitek Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)(DTK-UPS1500R+), or Equal

Western Digital Purple Surveillance Hard Drive(WV33PURZ), or Equal

SanDisk 240GB SSD Plus(SDSSDA-240G-G26), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 2TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST2000VX017), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 4TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST4000VX016), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD8RM), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Bullet Camera(VTC-THB2RMS), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant Video Management System(VT-SVRM10-C), or Equal

APC Back-UPS 850VA, 120V, USB charging ports, NEMA outlets 
(surge)(BE850G2), or Equal

Vitek – NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Bullet Camera
(VTC-THB8RM), or Equal.
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3.1.45

3.1.46

3.1.39

3.1.40

3.1.41
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3.1.33 100 #VALUE! 0.00% NO BID 100 #VALUE!



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.
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Catalog Discount Percentage

$ 1,681,512.50

$3,000.00 

$4,900

$8450

#VALUE!

25

NO BID

$30

$49

$338

100

100

100

0.00%

#VALUE!

3000

4900

8450

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

25

NO BID

$30

$49

$338

100

100

100

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 6MP 360º Transcendent Dome 
Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP 180º Transcendent Bullet 
Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-
8PNS), or Equal

Vitek 16 Port L2 Web Smart Ehternet Switch with PoE Injector(VT-16P250WS), or 
Equal

3.1.49

3.1.50

3.1.47

3.1.48

Vendor Signature & Date: HAMZA MASUD (1.16.2026)

Overall Total Cost

Any product or service not on the Agency provided Pricing Page will not be allowable.  The State cannot accept alternative pricing pages, failure to use Exhibit A - Pricing Page will lead to disqualification of Vendors Bid. Vendor should type or 
electronically enter the information into the Pricing Page to prevent errors in the evaluation.  Quantities listed herein are for bid evaluation purposes only, no guarantee of any actual quantities should be implied.

Vendor Name:  Swipe Resources LLC 

Bidder/Vendor Information

Address:  7491 Flag Point Ct.,

City, State, Zip:  Manassas, VA ,20109 

Phone Number: 703 870 6182

Email Address: hamza.masud@swiperesources.com
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BID RECEIVING LOCATION

 
 

 

 

 

 

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
David A Ferrell
304-352-0220
david.a.nolawski@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Swipe Resources LLC

7491 Flag Point Ct.

Manassas

Virginia USA

Hamza Masud

(703) 870-6182

20109

85-1143501 1/16/2026

VS0000045819
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

The West Virginia Department of Homeland Security - Division of Administrative Services, on behalf of the West Virginia Division of 
Corrections and Rehabilitation or agency, is soliciting bids to establish an open-end contract Catalog Contract for Security Cameras 
and Equipment. The equipment will be located at WVDCR facilities throughout the State of West Virginia. The cameras, NVR's and 

related equipment listed in this RFQ are required to maintain our current infrastructure and the equipment must be compatible to 
support our current infrastructure, with no additional cost to the state.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Vitek Video Surveillance Enterprise Mass 

Storage System
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.1-Vitek Video Surveillance Enterprise Mass Storage System(VT-TMSS24EN), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA compliant 

8MP Transcendent
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.2-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA compliant 8MP Transcendent Panoramic Camera(VTC-TNT2X4MSN), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP Dual Sensor 180 

Panoramic camera
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.3-Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP Dual Sensor 180 Panoramic camera(VTC-TNT2X4MSN), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 Transcendent Analog/HD-COAX IP Video 

Encoder Server
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.4-Transcendent Analog/HD-COAX IP Video Encoder Server(VT-IPE-HDA5), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 Vitek 64 Channel 16 Mega Pixel 4K Real Time 

Network Video
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.5-Vitek 64 Channel 16 Mega Pixel 4K Real Time Network Video Recorderd with GEN IV Advanced Analytics Support(VT-
TNR6480E1N), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 Transcendent 4 channel 

Decoder(VT-104VWD), or Equal
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.6-Transcendent 4 channel Decoder(VT-104VWD), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
7 Vitek POE 60-Watt mid-span injector(VT-

POE60-Watt), or Equal
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.7-Vitek POE 60-Watt mid-span injector(VT-POE60-Watt), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 Transcendent Series 4 MegaPixel License 

Plate Recognition
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.8-Transcendent Series 4 MegaPixel License Plate Recognition WDR IP Motorized Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB4LPRN-A), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 Wall Mount Gasket for Transcendent IP 

PTZs(VT-TPT25HR-WMG),
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.9-Wall Mount Gasket for Transcendent IP PTZs(VT-TPT25HR-WMG), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 95 Wall PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair 

compliant(VT-PoE95)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43222612    

Extended Description:
3.1.10-95 Wall PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE95), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 60 Watt PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair 

compliant(VT-PoE60)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43222612    

Extended Description:
3.1.11-60 Watt PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE60), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 Box for cable management for Large 9" 

Transcendent PTZ
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.12-Box for cable management for Large 9" Transcendent PTZ Cameras(VT-TPT-JB01), or Equal



Date Printed: Jan 15, 2026 Page:8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 3.5" Seagate SkyHawk AI 24TB Video Hard 

Drive(ST2400VE002),
50.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.13-3.5" Seagate SkyHawk AI 24TB Video Hard Drive(ST2400VE002), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 3.5" Seagate IronWolf Pro Video Surveillance 

Enterprice Mass
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.14-3.5" Seagate IronWolf Pro Video Surveillance Enterprice Mass Storage System(ST20000NT001), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Vitek-NDAA Compliant Transcendent series 

16 MegaPixel 360
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.15-Vitek-NDAA Compliant Transcendent series 16 MegaPixel 360 Panoramic IP Camera(VTD-TND16X8MS), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 Vitek Ceiling/Pedestal Mount(VT-TPT20HR-

PM), or Equal
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.16-Vitek Ceiling/Pedestal Mount(VT-TPT20HR-PM), or Equal



Date Printed: Jan 15, 2026 Page:10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 Extension Mounting Bracket(VT-TWM36), or 

Equal
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.17-Extension Mounting Bracket(VT-TWM36), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Extension Mounting Adapter(VT-TCNM36), or 

Equal
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.18-Extension Mounting Adapter(VT-TCNM36), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 Vitek - On Alert Series 4MP Wifi H.265 IP 

Bullet Camera
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.19-Vitek - On Alert Series 4MP Wifi H.265 IP Bullet Camera(VT-TNB4FW02), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8-Channel Netowrk 

Video Recorder
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.20-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8-Channel Netowrk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-TNR818PFN), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
21 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 16-Channel Netowk 

Video Recorder
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.21-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 16-Channel Netowk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-TNR1646PFN), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 32-Channel Network 

Video Recorder
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.22-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 32-Channel Network Video Recorder or NVR(VT-TNR3280E1N), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
23 Vitek - NDAA Compliant Hybrid Digital Video 

Recorder or DVR
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.23-Vitek - NDAA Compliant Hybrid Digital Video Recorder or DVR/NVR(VT-TR8NHA1620), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
24 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4Mp Bullet IP 

Camera(VTC-TNB4RMA4)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.24-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4Mp Bullet IP Camera(VTC-TNB4RMA4), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP Dome IP 

Camera(VTD-TND6MEA)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.25-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP Dome IP Camera(VTD-TND6MEA), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP 360 IP 

Panoramic Dome Camera
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.26-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP 360 IP Panoramic Dome Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
27 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP 180 IP 

Panoramic Bullet Camera
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.27-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP 180 IP Panoramic Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
28 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4MP PTZ IP 

Camera(VT-TPTZ4AD-4M)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.28-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ4AD-4M), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
29 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ IP 

Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-8PNS)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.29-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-8PNS), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Analog 

Dome Camera(VTD-THD2RMS
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.30-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD2RMS), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
31 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog 

Dome Camera(VTD-THD8RM)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.31-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD8RM), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
32 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Bullet 

Camera(VTC-THB2RMS)
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.32-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Bullet Camera(VTC-THB2RMS), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
33 Vitek - NDAA Compliant Video Management 

System(VT-SVRM10-C)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
52161545    

Extended Description:
3.1.34-Vitek - NDAA Compliant Video Management System(VT-SVRM10-C), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
34 APC Back-UPS 850VA, 120V, USB charging 

ports, NEMA outlets
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39121011    

Extended Description:
3.1.35-APC Back-UPS 850VA, 120V, USB charging ports, NEMA outlets (surge)(BE850G2), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
35 Vitek Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)

(DTK-UPS1500R+)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39121011    

Extended Description:
3.1.36-Vitek Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)(DTK-UPS1500R+), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
36 Western Digital Purple Surveillance Hard 

Drive(WV33PURZ)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.37-Western Digital Purple Surveillance Hard Drive(WV33PURZ), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
37 SanDisk 240GB SSD Plus(SDSSDA-240G-

G26), or Equal
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.38-SanDisk 240GB SSD Plus(SDSSDA-240G-G26), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
38 Seagate Skyhawk 2TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST2000VX017)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.39-Seagate Skyhawk 2TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST2000VX017), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
39 Seagate Skyhawk 4TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST4000VX016)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.40-Seagate Skyhawk 4TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST4000VX016), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
40 Seagate Skyhawk 6TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST6000VX001)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.41-Seagate Skyhawk 6TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST6000VX001), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
41 Seagate Skyhawk 8TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST8000VE001)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.42-Seagate Skyhawk 8TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST8000VE001), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
42 Seagate Skyhawk 10TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST10000VE001)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.43-Seagate Skyhawk 10TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST10000VE001), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
43 Seagate Skyhawk 12TB Surveillance Hard 

Drive(ST12000VE001)
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43201803    

Extended Description:
3.1.44-Seagate Skyhawk 12TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST12000VE001), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
44 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 

4MP Bullet IP
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.45-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 4MP Bullet IP Camera(TVC-TNB4RMA4), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
45 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 

5MP Dome IP Camera
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.46-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 5MP Dome IP Camera(TND5RMEA), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
46 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 

6MP 360
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.47-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 6MP 360 Transcendent Dome Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
47 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 

8MP 180
100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.48-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP 180 Transcendent Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
48 Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 

8MP PTZ Camera
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.49-Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-8PNS), or Equal
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
49 Vitek 16 Port L2 Web Smart Ehternet Switch 

with PoE Injector
25.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162300    

Extended Description:
3.1.50-Vitek 16 Port L2 Web Smart Ehternet Switch with PoE Injector(VT-16P250WS), or Equal

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

DIVISION OF CORRECTIONS 
- CENTRAL OFFICE

1124 SMITH STREET 1409 GREENBRIER ST STE 
300

SECOND FLOOR  

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
51 Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog 

Bullet Camera
(VTC-THB

100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46171610    

Extended Description:
3.1.33-Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Bullet Camera
(VTC-THB8RM)

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Questions due by 2:00PM EST 2025-12-29
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$4900

$8700

$6000

$4200

$49

$87

$60

$42

4900

8700

6000

4200

$60

$42

60 Watt PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE60), or Equal

Box for cable management for Large 9" Transcendent PTZ Cameras(VT-TPT-JB01), 
or Equal

$74625100$7470.00%74700

100

100

100

100

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

100

100

100

100

25 $24,200

3.1.7 $60 25 1500 0.00% $60 25 $1500

3.1.6 $968 25 24200 0.00%

25 $3937.5

3.1.5 $1230 25 30750 0.00% $1230 25 $123,000

3.1.4 $157.5 25 3937.5 0.00%

25

0.00% $405 100 $40,500

3.1.3 $390 100 39000 0.00% $390 100 $39,000

3.1.1

3.1.2 $405 100 40500

300000 0.00% $12000

$157.5

$968

3.1.8

3.1.9

3.1.10

3.1.11

3.1.12

Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

Vitek Video Surveillance Enterprise Mass Storage System(VT-TMSS24EN), or 
Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA compliant 8MP Transcendent Panoramic 
Camera(VTC-TNT2X4MSN), or Equal

$300,000

Transcendent Series 4 MegaPixel License Plate Recognition WDR IP Motorized 
Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB4LPRN-A), or Equal

Wall Mount Gasket for Transcendent IP PTZs(VT-TPT25HR-WMG), or Equal

95 Wall PoE Mid-Span injector, 4 pair compliant(VT-PoE95), or Equal

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$12000 25

100$747

$49

$87

Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP Dual Sensor 180º Panoramic camera(VTC-
TNT2X4MSNAD), or Equal

Transcendent Analog/HD-COAX IP Video Encoder Server(VT-IPE-HDA5), or Equal

Vitek 64 Channel 16 Mega Pixel 4K Real Time Network Video Recorderd with GEN 
IV Advanced Analytics Support(VT-TNR6480E1N), or Equal

Transcendent 4 channel Decoder(VT-104VWD), or Equal

Vitek POE 60-Watt mid-span injector(VT-POE60-Watt), or Equal



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

$280,000

50

25

100

NO BID

NO BID

$2800

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

280000

50

25

100

NO BID

NO BID

$2800

3.5" Seagate SkyHawk AI 24TB Video Hard Drive(ST2400VE002), or Equal

3.5" Seagate IronWolf Pro Video Surveillance Enterprice Mass Storage 
System(ST20000NT001), or Equal

Vitek-NDAA Compliant Transcendent series 16 MegaPixel 360º Panoramic IP 
Camera(VTD-TND16X8MS), or Equal

3.1.13

3.1.14

3.1.15



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$15,875

$20,625

$17,100

$27,800

$27,800

$4900

$12,400

$12,400

#VALUE!

$14,250

$36,000

$112,500

100

$825

$683

$278

$278

100

100

100

100

25

25

25

100

100

100

25

$360

$1,125

$635

$49

$124

$124

NO BID

$570

0.00%

20625

17075

27800

27800

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

36000

112500

15875

4900

12400

12400

#VALUE!

14250

100

$825

$683

$278

$278

100

100

100

100

25

25

25

100

100

100

25

$360

$1,125

$635

$49

$124

$124

NO BID

$570

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP Dome IP Camera(VTD-TND6MEA), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 6MP 360º IP Panoramic Dome Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), 
or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP 180º IP Panoramic Bullet Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), 
or Equal

Vitek Ceiling/Pedestal Mount(VT-TPT20HR-PM), or Equal

Extension Mounting Bracket(VT-TWM36), or Equal

Extension Mounting Adapter(VT-TCNM36), or Equal

Vitek - On Alert Series 4MP Wifi H.265 IP Bullet Camera(VT-TNB4FW02), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8-Channel Netowrk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR818PFN), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 16-Channel Netowk Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR1646PFN), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 32-Channel Network Video Recorder or NVR(VT-
TNR3280E1N), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant Hybrid Digital Video Recorder or DVR/NVR(VT-
TR8NHA1620), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4Mp Bullet IP Camera(VTC-TNB4RMA4), or Equal

3.1.16

3.1.17

3.1.23

3.1.24

3.1.25

3.1.26

3.1.27

3.1.18

3.1.19

3.1.20

3.1.21

3.1.22



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$145,500

$10,900

$41,700100

100

100

$417

$1,455

$109

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

41700

145500

10900

100

100

100

$417

$1,455

$109Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD2RMS), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 4MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ4AD-4M), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ IP Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-8PNS), or Equal

3.1.28

3.1.29

3.1.30



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$5,800

$1,575

$2,825

$4,550

$23,300

$9800

$161,250

$4500

$22,750

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

25

25

100

25

25

25

100

100

25

25

25

$232

NO BID

NO BID

$63

$113

$182

$233

$98

$6,450

$180

$910

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

5800

#VALUE!

#VALUE!

1575

2825

4550

23300

9800

161250

4500

22750

25

25

100

25

25

25

100

100

25

25

25

$232

NO BID

NO BID

$63

$113

$182

$233

$98

$6,450

$180

$910

NO BID

Seagate Skyhawk 6TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST6000VX001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 8TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST8000VE001), or Equal

Vitek Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)(DTK-UPS1500R+), or Equal

Western Digital Purple Surveillance Hard Drive(WV33PURZ), or Equal

SanDisk 240GB SSD Plus(SDSSDA-240G-G26), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 2TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST2000VX017), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 4TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST4000VX016), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Dome Camera(VTD-THD8RM), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant 2MP HD Bullet Camera(VTC-THB2RMS), or Equal

Vitek - NDAA Compliant Video Management System(VT-SVRM10-C), or Equal

APC Back-UPS 850VA, 120V, USB charging ports, NEMA outlets 
(surge)(BE850G2), or Equal

Vitek – NDAA Compliant 8MP HD Analog Bullet Camera
(VTC-THB8RM), or Equal.

3.1.39

3.1.40

3.1.41

3.1.42

3.1.34

3.1.35

3.1.36

3.1.37

3.1.38

3.1.31

3.1.32

3.1.33 100 #VALUE! 0.00% NO BID 100 #VALUE!



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$5,800

$7,200

$8,300

#VALUE!

$3,000

25

25

25

100

100

$232

$288

$332

NO BID

$30

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

5800

7200

8300

#VALUE!

3000

25

25

25

100

100

$232

$288

$332

NO BID

$30
Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 5MP Dome IP Camera(TND5RMEA), 

or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 8TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST8000VE001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 10TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST10000VE001), or Equal

Seagate Skyhawk 12TB Surveillance Hard Drive(ST12000VE001), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 4MP Bullet IP Camera(TVC-
TNB4RMA4), or Equal

3.1.44

3.1.45

3.1.46

3.1.42

3.1.43



Discounted 
Unit Price

Quantity Discounted Total Cost
Contract 

Item 
Number

Description
Catalog Unit 

Price
Quantity Total Cost

Discount 
Percentage

The Items Listed below are a sample market basket of the Vendors Catalog.  Vendor must quote a discount percentage off the list price of products listed in Vendors Catalog.

Exhibit A - Pricing Page
Security Cameras & Equipment

ARFQ 0608 DCR2600000073

Catalog Discount Percentage

$ 1,681,512.50

$3,000.00 

$4,900

$8450

#VALUE!

25

NO BID

$30

$49

$338

100

100

100

0.00%

#VALUE!

3000

4900

8450

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

25

NO BID

$30

$49

$338

100

100

100

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 6MP 360º Transcendent Dome 
Camera(VTD-TND6FPN), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP 180º Transcendent Bullet 
Camera(VTC-TNB8X4MS), or Equal

Mounting Bracket for Vitek NDAA Compliant 8MP PTZ Camera(VT-TPTZ32HRAN-
8PNS), or Equal

Vitek 16 Port L2 Web Smart Ehternet Switch with PoE Injector(VT-16P250WS), or 
Equal

3.1.49

3.1.50

3.1.47

3.1.48

Vendor Signature & Date: HAMZA MASUD (1.16.2026)

Overall Total Cost

Any product or service not on the Agency provided Pricing Page will not be allowable.  The State cannot accept alternative pricing pages, failure to use Exhibit A - Pricing Page will lead to disqualification of Vendors Bid. Vendor should type or 
electronically enter the information into the Pricing Page to prevent errors in the evaluation.  Quantities listed herein are for bid evaluation purposes only, no guarantee of any actual quantities should be implied.

Vendor Name:  Swipe Resources LLC 

Bidder/Vendor Information

Address:  7491 Flag Point Ct.,

City, State, Zip:  Manassas, VA ,20109 

Phone Number: 703 870 6182

Email Address: hamza.masud@swiperesources.com
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